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BOOK REVIEWS 
 
Yarimar Bonilla (2015). Non-sovereign futures: French Caribbean politics in the wake of 
disenchantment. Chicago IL: University of Chicago Press. ISBN: 978-0-2262-8378-4. 
vii+215pp. US$85 (cloth).   

 
What configurations of struggle and desire emerge from a tactical and ideological 

disenchantment with postcolonial sovereignty? What forms of political struggle/struggle in 
political forms does disenchantment prompt? What is political form after methodological 
nationalism? It is in turning to Guadeloupe with anthropologist Yarimar Bonilla— to the 
archipelago’s militant labour movement across shifting contexts of status and rule—that I pose 
these questions. In Non-sovereign futures, Bonilla refracts current Guadeloupean labour 
organisation through a French Antillean political genealogy that has long wrestled with its own 
structural tangle with “the conceptual arsenal of political modernity” and its “seductive but 
constraining” constitutive categories: freedom, sovereignty, nation and revolution (p. 3). From 
abolition and colonial incorporation (1794) to citizenship (1848), departmentalisation (1946), 
new syndicalism (1970s) and guerrilla insurgence (1980s), Guadeloupean resistance unfolds 
as a sustained struggle towards an assembly of concepts, tactics and configurations forged 
within and against the “epistemic binds” of political modernity and racial capitalism (p. 15).  

 
The stakes of contemporary labour activism lie in this inherited bind, the ongoing 

conscription into compulsory categories of thought. But ours, Bonilla writes, is a moment of 
categorical uncertainty.  In the wake of a national liberation model, Guadeloupean militants re-
conceptualised their anticolonial movement as a workers’ movement. This mode of 
postcolonial syndicalism weds the institutional strength of French labour with the tactical and 
ideological openings of anti-colonialism, restructuring the trade union movement as a meeting 
ground where labour conflict opens onto broader forms of political mobilisation. “The result,” 
Bonilla writes, “is a social movement that infuses labour struggles with battles over historic 
memory, Creole language use, racial and ethnic politics, and the search for alternative forms 
of political, economic autonomy” (p. 4).  

 
Postcolonial syndicalism disenchants and is disenchanted by the regulating categories of 

struggle, exerting pressure on the analytic primacy of nation, independence and sovereignty. 
Through labour and hunger strikes, memory walks, rumour and myth, in their strategies of 
rupture and retreat, redaction and revelation, postcolonial syndicalists exercise a profound bond 
to the forms of conceptual capture that preceded them: “They are ready to bid farewell to the 
failed projects and unfulfilled promises of the previous era but have yet to bury the conceptual 
frameworks, political expectations and historical legacies of their forebear s...” (p. 39).    

 
Of particular importance to Bonilla’s account is the mid 20th century consolidation of 

sovereignty as a regulating horizon for radical struggle and postcolonial normative ideal. 
Bonilla flags how certain decolonisation projects mobilised nation-states as “discrete” and 
“necessary” units of organisation while “silencing and foreclosing other forms of alignment” 
(p. 11). But, just as the post-emancipation problem/project of freedom met eliminating 
alternatives to the wage economy, “[t]he postcolonial project of sovereignty … produced a 
series of institutions, most notably the UN, and moral compulsions …  a system of international 
debt and finance through which to ‘develop,’ modernize and assist emerging nations …” (p. 
13). For Bonilla, “we have never been sovereign” and this categorical problem of sovereignty 
points towards alternative configurations and archives for thinking about autonomy, conflict 
and resistance (p. 10). Drawing from Antonio Benitez-Rojo, Bonilla understands the wider 
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Caribbean as a non-sovereign archipelago, or a “discontinuous conjunction” of repeatedly 
constrained sovereignties; and postcolonial syndicalism as a “project in search for a non-
sovereign future” (p. 10). As contemporary syndicalists organise within and against the 
conditions of postcolonial sovereignty, they forge modes of struggle and desire that breach 
protocols of conceptual inheritance, problematising the nation as an aspirational configuration 
of power in the process.  

 
In chapter two, “Strategic entanglement,” Bonilla turns to the centrality of marronage 

and the figure of the rebel/runaway slave (neg mawon) as a complex of resistance and tactical 
orientation among labour activists. Lukas, a UGTG union organiser, understands the trade 
union as a guerrilla operation modelled after the political practices of neg mawon: 
confrontation, sabotage, extraction, retreat. In Lukas’ account, union organisers “strategically 
pillage French trade unionism” by using the labour strike as a tool while refusing mediation 
and dialogue (p. 42). For Bonilla, Lukas’ reading of marronage is a non-nationalist vision of 
strategic entanglement, “a way of crafting an enacting autonomy within a system from which 
one is unable to fully disentangle” (p. 43). For Lukas, political independence is not autonomy, 
for autonomy retains within in it the capacity for a certain kind of guerrilla function, 

 
It’s not that I don’t believe in independence for Guadeloupe.  It’s that I don’t believe in 
independence! It doesn’t exist – anywhere …!” (p. 40).  
 
To diminish, constrain or hold hostage the guerrilla function is to diminish, constrain and 

hold hostage the possibility for autonomy. Lukas pursues political arrangements that amplify 
the tactical positionality of the rebel slave, enabling the guerrilla function, 

 
What did the neg mawon do? ... It was guerrilla warfare. And you know, that’s what 
the union does here. Every time there is a period of calm—bam! A new strike is 
unleashed. Every time the explorer thinks they have won—guerrilla! (p. 41). 

 
Some of the most stunning interventions emerge in Bonilla’s thick description from the 

picket line, behind the barricade, on the memory walk. She tours these scenes of suspension to 
draw out the affective life of struggle. Bonilla explores the way in which the picket line nurtures 
complicated experiences of inter-dependence and mutual aid, precarity and personal 
transformation.  And, despite the disappointments that follow – fired comrades, unfulfilled 
contractual obligations – the strike is always another space of encounter:  a tear in time.  Bonilla 
beautifully captures the vitality and scope of organised labour in Guadeloupe. Her discussion 
of memory walks as forms of historiographical praxis initiated by labour organisers is also 
stirring. On a memory walk, participants are bussed to a meeting point and led through a series 
of historical locations. At each site, someone provides testimony: this can be a historical expert 
but more often is someone with a personal connection to the event in remembrance. The walk 
concludes with a collective meal of symbolic local foods. Memory walks serve as mediums for 
‘feeling history,” for encountering “nature as an archive of traces,” for studying through 
movement (p. 141). It is an opportunity to gather differently.  

 
For Bonilla, Guadeloupe’s political history invites rethinking sovereignty as a regulating 

horizon for radical struggle and a turn to what she calls non-sovereign futures. Thinking in the 
wake of Non-sovereign futures and across the non-sovereign archipelago, I am intrigued by 
how sovereignty’s emergence as a conceptual terrain in distinct colonial projects shapes the 
way it is encountered, mobilised and theorised. This would mean, for example, thinking 
through the ongoing historical demand for Haiti to relinquish its sovereignty alongside 



                                                       Small States & Territories, Vol. 3, No. 1, May 2020, pp. 249-258 

 251

Guadeloupe’s postcolonial syndicalism and its critique of the nation-state project. And, 
perhaps, this is the practice of guerrilla thought. 
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Tuila’epa Sa’ilele Malielegaoi & Peter Swain (2017). Pālemia: A memoir. Wellington, New 
Zealand: Victoria University Press. 301pp, Hbk. ISBN: 978-1-77656-115-5. NZ$49.99. 

A memoir offer readers a window into someone’s life. It provides an informative 
snapshot and knowledge about a subject. Simultaneously, it can also attract reactions, at times 
misguided when given out of context or when one does not possess a degree of familiarity and 
intimacy with the subject. Outsiders are often accused of this, particularly in cultural spaces 
where open and critical debate are not encouraged. However, an outsider’s view is just as 
relevant, so long as it is considered and delivered with an openness and respect towards mutual 
learning and understanding. Reviews offer this opportunity and, in this particular case, to learn 
about and engage with story of a visionary statesman and an exemplary Pacific leader, 
Tuila’epa Sa’ilele Malielegaoi, Pālemia or Prime Minister of Samoa, who has penned his 
memoir with Peter Swain, a long time Pacific development specialist. Samoa is the first Pacific 
nation to gain political independence (as Western Samoa, in 1962). It has population of 
approximately 197,000 and has about the same number in the diaspora.   

Tuila’epa was elected to office in 1998 and is the longest serving Prime Minister of 
Samoa.  In his foreword to the book, Tuila’epa is very clear about the intentions behind the 
volume:  the memoir is “a simple political story”, closely connected to the development and 
success of party politics and that of the Human Rights Protection Party (HRPP) against the 
backdrop of a society navigating the realities of culture and modernity.  

The memoir has six chapters. The first opens with the assassination attempt on 
Tuila’epa’s life, nine months after he was elected to office; and the concluding chapter reflects 
on his leadership and the associated era of political and economic stability. The rest of the 
chapters detail Tuila’epa’s journey from the village of Lepa to the office of Prime Minister. 
Young Tuila’epa’s story will resonate with readers who have experienced a rural upbringing; 
the separate bath pools, night games and walks to school, attending Christian schools, living 
with urban relatives and an overseas education. The stories are enough to make one smile, 
giggle and turn nostalgic about the past. The older Tuila’epa was a seasoned bureaucrat, over 
time honing his political craft whilst navigating Samoan socio-cultural dynamics. Given the 
memoir’s focus, it would be natural to offer a political review. That is not my intention; I 
reserve that to those who have a taste for it. Instead, I broadly explore the memoir’s relevance 
to three issues of interest: young people, Pacific leadership and higher education in small states 
and territories. 

Reference to young people in the memoir is sporadic. However, it is specific in describing 
the place and role of young people as embedded in Fa’asamoa (or, the Samoan way of life). 
Youth were referred to as executioners of chiefly orders and at times used by adults with 
political motives to erect roadblocks and illegally occupy land.  At the same time, the young 
people were exposed to significant events hosted by Samoa like the 2007 South Pacific Games, 
2014 Small Islands Development States (SIDS) Conference and the 2015 Commonwealth 
Youth Games. One has only to read the SIDS Pre-Conference Talavou (Youth) Forum 


